BID TABULATION
PICKENS COUNTY

BID #2013-01 July 12th 2:00 p.m.

2013 Paving Bid Tabulation

Street Name

District 1 F & R Asphalt King Asphalt Panagakos Asphalt Venesky Asphalt
Forest Lane No Bid 22,650.00 No Bid 24,752.00
Foy Creek No Bid 7,500.00 No Bid 10,866.00
Goldman Street 49,500.00 42,500.00 No Bid 52,300.00
Hedgerow Lane 1&2 No Bid 19,300.00 No Bid 23,547.00
Monaco 1,2,3 58,750.00 49,600.00 No Bid 57,490.00
Pine Street No Bid 24,350.00 No Bid 27,931.00
Tabor Street 67,835.00 64,200.00 No Bid 63,164.00
Upper Highland 49,725.00 44,000.00 No Bid 57,192.00
Stoney Creek No Bid 36,800.00 No Bid 53,786.00
District 2

Bridgewater Road 29,900.00 20,350.00 No Bid 26,562.00
Central Landfill Road 28,850.00 22,100.00 No Bid 26,897.00
College Street 99,650.00 94,300.00 No Bid 122,820.00
Deer Trail 146,500.00 121,200.00 No Bid 151,800.00
Horton Street 26,750.00 21,350.00 No Bid 25,349.00
Lacustrine Lane 54,800.00 46,550.00 No Bid 70,986.00
Lakeside Drive 128,500.00 112,200.00 No Bid 141,421.00
Oak Bend Manor 29,875.00 27,000.00 No Bid 35,947.00
Pine Grove Church Rd 192,500.00 168,300.00 No Bid 212,294.00
Riverdale Road 34,750.00 32,300.00 No Bid 33,570.00
Shemiah Road 49,475.00 44,900.00 No Bid 59,621.00
Woodson Street 15,850.00 9,600.00 No Bid 13,449.00
District 3

Adam Road 119,275.00 106,800.00 No Bid 130,855.00
N. Mt Tabor Church Rd 108,800.00 105,900.00 No Bid 116,054.00
Whitecrest Way 129,475.00 114,300.00 No Bid 125,855.00
District 4

Crane Street No Bid 16,200.00 No Bid 23,957.00
Evergreen Circle No Bid 9,300.00 No Bid 13,359.00
James Street No Bid 4,800.00 No Bid 9,123.00
Mountain Crest Drive No Bid 54,550.00 No Bid 71,716.00
Oak Lane No Bid 17,200.00 No Bid 23,727.00
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District 5

Barton Street No Bid 32,200.00 40,647.00 35,789.00
Belmont Circle No Bid 21,200.00 26,064.00 24,301.00
Bishop Drive No Bid 69,200.00 82,686.00 68,617.00
Boulder Court No Bid 15,100.00 18,976.00 18,716.00
Farmer Street No Bid 7,700.00 16,875.00 16,326.00
Gilland Avenue No Bid 18,400.00 22,605.00 19,194.00
Luke Court No Bid 12,900.00 17,120.00 13,819.00
McCallister Trace No Bid 21,650.00 19,368.00 29,570.00
Mikenah Court No Bid 18,600.00 24,765.00 26,714.00
Nicholas Court No Bid 15,100.00 21,730.00 25,163.00
Pebble Court No Bid 9,000.00 11,304.00 13,258.00
Rockmont Road 49,875.00 42,700.00 61,149.00 48,981.00
Rosewood Drive No Bid 18,500.00 28,469.00 32,016.00
Stone Haven Lane No Bid 40,300.00 57,416.00 50,478.00
District 6

Norta Vista Drive No Bid 28,700.00 No Bid 30,992.00
Dianne Drive No Bid 19,650.00 No Bid 8,466.00
Shamrock Court No Bid 15,300.00 14,279.00 27,980.00
Mandy Trail No Bid 21,600.00 No Bid 35,550.00
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